PECHANGA INDIAN RESERVATION Tribal Chairmnan:

Temecula Band of Luisefio Mission Indians Mark Macarro
Post Office Box 1477 « Temecula, CA 92593 T“balogg“jfcgésqu& -
Telephone (951} 770-6000 Fax (951) 695-1778 C‘ la’ataum“‘ R, Chacon
Marc Luker
Rabert "R.J." Munaoa
RESOLUTION OF THE Russell “Butch” Murphy
PECHANGA BAND OF LUISENO INDIANS Michael A. Vasquez
PECHANGA INDIAN RESERVATION Tribal Secretary:
Loulse Burke
Tribal Treasurer:
RESOLUTION# 180128-05a Robym Deumuge

PURPOSE: Enactment of the Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance.

WHEREAS: The Temecula Band of Luisefio Indians, sometimes referred to as the Pechanga
Band of Luisefio Indians, federally recognized as the Pechanga Band of Luisefio
Mission Indians of the Pechanga Reservation (hereafter referred to as the “Band™),
is a sovereign federally recognized Indian Tribe; and

WHEREAS: The General Membership of the Band is the governing body of the Pechanga
Indian Reservation and is governed by the Band’s Constitution and Bylaws; and

WHEREAS: The Band is a customs and traditions tribe and desires to promote and protect its
customs and traditions, rights, interests, common welfare, and enhance services to
its members; and

WHEREAS: The Band is entitled to exercise all rights afforded to it under applicable law; and

WHEREAS: The Band desires to regulate and establish minimum requirements to safeguard the
public health, safety and general welfare through structural strength, means of
egress facilities, stability, sanitation, adequate light and ventilation, energy
conservation, and safety to life and property from fire and other hazards attributed
to the built environment and to provide a reasonable level] of safety to fire fighters
and emergency responders during emergency operations, as set forth in the Non-
Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance (aitached hereto as Exhibit
A).

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED THAT: It has been determined by the General
Membership of the Pechanga Band of Luisefio Indians that it is in the best interest of the Band

to enact the Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance (attached hereto as
Exhibit A).

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT: The General Membership of the Pechanga Band of
Luisefio Indians, as the lawful sovereign authority of the Band, hereby enacts the Non-Gaming
Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance (attached hereto as Exhibit A).

FMABTMB1Z0DIDIRY
Page | of 2



BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED THAT: This Resolution and the authorizations contained
herein shall remain valid and continue in effect year-after-year until amended, modified, or
rescinded by the General Membership.

CERTIFICATION

We, the undersigned, the duly elected officers of the Temecula Band of Luisefio Indians,
sometimes referred to as the Pechanga Band of Luisefio Indians, federally recognized as the
Pechanga Band of Luisefio Mission Indians of the Pechanga Reservation, do hereby certify that
the foregoing Resolution (No. 180128-05a) was adopted at a duly noticed General Membership
Meeting held on the 28 day of January, 2018 by a vote of 110 yes, 3 no, and 2 abstaining,
and that such Resolution has not been rescinded or amended in any way.

AVALELEY LTALAG/CALLYFy L LAV/WLL wcRELAALELLLLLL

s / "

. Chacon, Councjlwoman M1chael A. Nasguez, Counc1

Robert ff{ J.” Munoa, Councilman

Vo 57l

Marc Luker, Councilman

PECHANGA INDIAN RESERVATION #MABTMBIZODIDIRV]

Page 2.0f2
Temecula Band of Luisefio Mission Indians °



Exhibit A
to General Membership Resolution No. 180128-05a

Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance

PECHANGA INDIAN RESERVATION

Temecula Bard of Luisefio Mission Indians



PECHANGA BAND OF LUISENO INDIANS CODE OF ORDINANCES
TITLE 8
BUILDING & FIRE SAFETY CODE
DIVISION 2
NON-GAMING AREAS
ARTICLE 1
NON-GAMING NON-RESIDENTIAL BUILDING AND FIRE ORDINANCE

1.1  Title. This Ordinance shall be known and cited as the Non-Gaming Non-Residential
Building and Fire Ordinance (“Ordinance™), Pechanga Code of Ordinances Title 8, Division 2,
Article 1.

1.2 Authority & Enactment. This Ordinance was enacted by the Pechanga General
Membership, the authorized governing body of the Pechanga Band of Luisefio Indians, as
evidenced by General Membership Resolution No. 180128-05a.

1.3 Purpose. The purpose of this Ordinance is to provide for the tribal regulation of and to
establish the minimum requirements to safeguard the public health, safety and general welfare
through structural strength, means of egress facilities, stability, sanitation, adequate light and
ventilation, energy conservation, and safety to life and property from fire and other hazards
attributed to the built environment and to provide a reasonable level of safety to fire fighters and
emergency responders during emergency operations.

1.4 Scope. This Ordinance shall apply to the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement,
replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, maintenance, removal and
demolition of every Building or any appurtenances connected or attached to such Buildings of all
Non-Gaming Facilities located within the Reservation. This Ordinance does not apply to detached
one and two family dwellings and townhouses not more than 3 stories above grade plan in height
with a separate means of egress and their accessory structures not more than 3 stories above grade
plane in height.

1.5 Definitions. As used in this Ordinance, the capitalized terms set forth below shall have the
following meanings;

(a) Applicable Codes. Applicable Codes means those codes identified in Sections 1.7
and 1.8.

(b)  Applicant. Applicant means any person who submits a building or fire permit
application or variance request for the purpose of obtaining approval under this Ordinance.

(c) Band. Band means the Pechanga Band of Luisefio Indians, sometimes referred to
as the Temecula Band of Luisefio Indians, federally recognized as the Pechanga Band of Luisefio
Mission Indians of the Pechanga Reservation.

Adopted January 28, 2018 1 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Gaming Areas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



(d) Building. Building means any structure, either temporary or permanent, having a
roof and used or built for shelter, or the enclosure of person, animals, or property of any kind,
which is used for commercial, industrial, retail, or tribal government purposes.

(e) Building Official. Building Official means the officer or other designated authority
charged with the administration and enforcement of this Ordinance for all commercial, retail, and

tribal government Buildings developed hereunder, or a duly authorized representative as approved
by the Tribal Council.

(f) Fire Code Official. Fire Code Official means the Fire Chief, Fire Marshal, or the
Fire Chief’s designee charged with the administration and enforcement of this Ordinance.

() Fire Chief. Fire Chief means the chief officer of the Pechanga Fire Department or
the Fire Chief’s designee.

(h) Non-Gaming Facility. Non-Gaming Facility means any Building not subject to the
terms of the tribal-state compact entered into between the Band and the State of California and
approved by the Secretary as published in Federal Register Notice on December 5, 2016,
governing the conduct of class III paming activities by the Band pursuant to Indian Gaming
Repulatory Act.

(1) Non-Residential. Any building or any appurtenances connected or attached to such
buildings with the exception of detached one and two family dwellings and townhouses not more
than 3 stories above prade plan in height with a separate means of egress and their accessory
structures not more than 3 stories above prade plane in height.

4} Permit. Permit means an official document or certificate issued by the authority
having jurisdiction which authorizes performance of a specific activity regulated by this
Ordinance.

(k) Project. Project means the construction of any Building pursuant to this Ordinance.

)] Tribal Council. Tribal Council means the duly elected body of the Band pursuant
to the Constitution and which is the governmental entity, or its designee, that has the statutory
authority to perform the duties and responsibilities required pursuant to this Ordinance. The Tribal
Council has the statutory authority to delegate some or all of its statutory authority to the
appropriate tribal entities or individuals, as may be determined by the Tribal Council.

{m) Reservation. Reservation means all lands within the limits of the Band’s
Reservation or land over which the Band exercises governmental power, and that is held in trust
by the United States for the benefit of the Band.

(m) Variance. Variance means a modification when a special condition exists that
makes strict compliance with this Ordinance impractical, or when an alternative materials and
methods design that complies with the intent of this Ordinance, and that the material, method, or
work offered is, for the purpose intended, at least the equivalent of that prescribed in the Applicable
Codes in quality, strenpth, effectivencss, fire resistance, durability, and safety. The resulting

Adopted January 28, 2018 2 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Gaming Areas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



condition must be in conformance with the spirit and purpose of the code provisions invelved and
that such modification does not lessen fire protection, structural integrity, or occupant safety.

1.6 Administration and Enforcement.

(a) Building Official.

(1) The Building Official is responsible for administering and enforcing the
provisions of this Ordinance for the development of any commercial, retail, and Tribal
Government Buildings within the Reservation. The Building Official shall have the authority to
render interpretations of this Ordinance and to adopt policies and procedures in order to clarify the
application of its provisions. Such interpretation, policies, and procedures shall be in compliance
with the intent and purpose of this Ordinance. Such policies and procedures shall not have the
effect of waiving requirements provided for in this Ordinance.

(2)  The Building Official shall report to the Tribal Council on a regular basis
regarding building and fire safety matters within the Reservation.

3) The Building Official must be qualified as a “Certified Building Official”
under the requirements of the International Code Council (“ICC”) or equivalent as determined by
the Tribal Council; must have a minimum of two (2) years’ experience as a building official,
preferably with a governmental entity, and must submit to the Tribal Council, or its designee, on
an triennial basis, a report indicating proof of compliance with all applicable requirements for
continuing education and as required by the ICC for maintenance of certification. If the Building
Official is hired as a governmental employee of the Band, they shall be covered by the existing
liability insurance coverage provided by the Band to employees during the course of their
employment. If the Building Official is retained as an independent contractor, they shall be
responsible for providing their own liability insurance coverage as required by the terms of their
individual contract with the Band.

(4)  Inaccordance with and concurrence of the Tribal Council, deputies shall be
appointed by the Building Official for inspections, plans examiners, and other employees as
needed to administer the provisions of this Ordinance. ICC certifications shall be required for the
appointed deputies in the disciplines of expertise and included in the triennial report provided by
the Building Official.

(b)  Fire Code Official.

(D The Fire Code Official is responsible for administering and enforcing the
provisions of this Ordinance for the development, maintenance, and use of commercial, retail, and
Tribal Government Buildings, including access for the Pechanga Fire Department to land to
perform activities related to the prevention, suppression, and extinguishment of fires; access to a
sufficient water supply, storage, handling, and use of hazardous materials; installation,
modification, and maintenance of fire protection systems, and construction; maintenance of means
of egress; elimination of fire and safety hazards on land, in buildings and structures including those

Adopted January 28, 2018 3 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Gaming Arecas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



under construction; investigation of cause, origin, and circumstances of fire and unauthorized
releases of hazardous materials within the Reservation.

(2)  The Fire Chief or Fire Code Official in charge at the scene of a fire or other
emergency involving the protection of life or property or any part thereof, shall have the authority
to direct and perform emergency operations, investigate reported or suspected fires or other
hazardous conditions, take reasonable action to prevent or mitigate any hazardous conditions,
enforce provisions of this Ordinance, and prohibit or remove any person, vehicle, vessel, or thing
that could impede or interfere with Pechanga Fire Department operations.

() Development Plan Consistency Determination.

(1 In addition to other permits and approvals by the Band, any permit required
by this Ordinance shall be secured prior to the development of any lot or modification of any
existing Building on the Reservation and as specified within the Ordinance.

(2 A Plan Consistency Determination Certificate must be secured, prior to the
initiation, modification, or expansion of use or development.

(3) A Plan Consistency Determination certifies that a proposed development
conforms to all current requirements of applicable tribal consistency regulations and, if applicable,
the terms and conditions of any previously approved development permit.

(4) A Plan Consistency Determination is required whenever a building permit
is required, and must be secured prior to the issuance of the building permit. A Plan Consistency
Determination Certificate shall be applied for with the application for a building permit.

) A Plan Consistency Determination is required when deemed necessary by
the Fire Code Official to evaluate activities requiring an operational or construction fire permit
under this Ordinance.

(d) Building Permit.

(1) A building permit is required by any owner or authorized agent who intends
to construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, demolish, or change the occupancy of a Building, or to
erect, install, alter, repair, remove, convert or replace any electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing
system, the installation of which is regulated pursuant to the standards adopted in Section 2.7.

(2)  Any Project on the Reservation regulated hereunder that is found to be in
violation of this Ordinance shall be issued a stop order immediately and may be subject to fines if
a building permit is not secured in a timely manner, pursuant to Sections 2.16-2.20 of this
Ordinance.

(e) Occupancy Certificate.

(1)  No dwelling or Building subject to the provisions of this Ordinance shall be
occupied or used until the Building Official has issued a Certificate of Occupancy to the owner or
his duly authorized agent. Within five (5) days after notification that the dwelling or Building is

Adopted January 28, 2018 4 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Cade
Division 2: Non-Gaming Areas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



ready for occupancy, the Building Official shall make a final inspection thereof, and if it is found
to be in conformity with the provisions of this Ordinance, shall issue the owner or his agent a
Certificate of Occupancy.

(2) Prior to the Certificate of Occupancy being issued, two (2) sets of as-build-
drawings shall be filed with the Building Official, with a certification by the contractor that all
work has been done in accordance with the requirements of the relevant Permit. If all conditions
have been met, a Certificate of Occupancy shall be issued within ten (10) business days after the
final inspection is completed.

(f) Fire Permit.

(1) A fire permit is required by any owner or authorized agent who intends to
conduct an operation or business, or install or modify systems and equipment that are regulated by
this Ordinance, or to cause any such work to be performed.

(1) Operational Fire Permit. An operational permit allows the Applicant
to conduct an operation or business requiring a permit by this Ordinance for a prescribed period,
or until renewed or revoked.

(i1) Construction Fire Permit. A construction fire permit allows the
Applicant to install or modify systems and equipment as permitted by this Ordinance.

2) Any Project on the Reservation regulated hercunder that is found to be in
violation of this Ordinance shall be issued a stop order immediately, and may be subject to fines
if a fire permit is not secured in a timely manner, or if an activity prompts an emergency response,
pursuant to Sections 2.16-2.20 of this Ordinance.

1.7  Applicable Codes. To accomplish the objectives of this Ordinance, the Band hereby
adopts the following codes, to apply to all Non-Gaming Facilities located within the Reservation:
the latest effective edition of the International Building Codes, National Electrical Code, Uniform
Plumbing Code, Uniform Mechanical Code and National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code hereto
adopted by reference within Section 1.8, and as amended within Section 1.9 (collectively,
hereinafter, the “Applicable Codes™); provided, however, that the Tribal Council shall have the
authority to require design consultants and construction contractors to design and build to more
stringent standards as the Band may impose. Nothing in this section shall be deemed to waive the
sovereign immunity of the Band or any of its enterprises, officers, agents or employees, nor does
the adoption of the referenced codes require the Band to comply with any laws to which it would
not ordinarily be subject.

1.8  Applicable Codes Adopted By Reference. The following model codes are hereby adopted
by reference, subject to the amendments identified in Section 2.9.

(a) Building Code. The International Building Code, including Appendices C, I, E, G,
and J, published by the International Code Council, 4051 West Flossinoor Road, Country Club
Hills, Il 60478-5795.

Adopted January 28, 2018 5 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Gaming Areas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residentizl Building and Fire Ordinance



(b) Fire Code. The International Fire Code, including Appendices published by the
International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, 11 60478-5795,

including amendments contained within applicable state and local codes.

{c) Mechanical Code. The Uniform Mechanical Code, published by the International
Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, 4755 E. Philadelphia Street, Ontario, CA
91761.

(d) Plumbing Code. The Uniform Plumbing Code, including Appendix C, published
by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, 4755 E. Philadelphia
Street, Ontario, CA 91761.

(e) Energy Code. The International Energy Conservation Code, published by the
International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, 11 60478-5795.

(f) Electrical Code. The National Elecirical Code published by the National Fire
Protection Association, Inc., 1 Batterymarch Park, Quincy, MA (02269,

(g)  Existing Building Code. The International Existing Building Code, published by
the International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, I1 60478-5795.

(h) WUI Code. International Wildland Urban Interface Code, published by the
International Code Council, 4051 West Flossnioor Road, Country Club Hills, 11 60478-5795.

(i) Swimming Pool and Spa Code. International Swiniming Pool and Spa Code,
published by the International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, 11
60478-5795.

1.9 Amendments to Applicable Codes.

(a) Building Code. The following amendments are hereby made to the International
Building Code:

(1) Section 101.4.4 Property maintenance. This section to be deleted in its
entirety.

2) Section (A} 102.2 Other laws. This section is to be deleted in its entirety
and replaced with the following: The provision of this Code shall not be deemed to nullify any
provisions of law as to the Band’s inherent sovereign authority, and the powers vested to it under
the Constitution and Bylaws, adopted December 10, 1978, and as may be amended from time to
time (“Constitution”). Nothing in this section shall be deemed to waive the sovereign immunity of
the Band or any of its enterprises, officers, agents or eniployees, nor does the adoption of the
referenced codes require the Band to comply with any laws to which it would not ordinarily be
subject.

3 Section 103.3 Deputies. This section to be deleted in its entirety and
replaced with the following: Criteria for deputies of the Building Official to be provided as per
1.6(a)(4) of the Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance.

Adopted January 28, 2018 6 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Gaming Areas
Article 1: Nen-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



(4) Section 202. Amend Section 202 to include the following new definition,
as follows: STRUCTURAL OBSERVATION. The visual observation of the structural system
encompassing the structure, foundation elements and soils within the influence zone of the
foundation elements by a registered design professional for general conformance to the approved
construction documents. Structural observation does not include or waive the responsibility for the
inspection required by Section 110, 1705 or other sections of this code.

(5) Section (A) 102.11 Other laws. This section is to be deleted in its entirety
and replaced with the following: The provision of this code shall not be deemed to nullify any
provisions of law as to the Band’s inherent sovereign authority, and the powers vested to it under
the Constitution and Bylaws, adopted December 10, 1978, and as may be amended from time to
time (“Constitution”). Nothing in this section shall be deemed to waive the sovereign immunity of
the Band or any of its enterprises, officers, agents or employees, nor does the adoption of the
referenced codes require the Band to comply with any laws to which it would not ordinarily be
subject.

(b) Mechanical Code. The following amendments are hereby made to the Uniform
Mechanical Code:

(1)  Add Section 101.1.1.: The provision of this code shall not be deemed to
nullify any provisions of law as to the Band’s inherent sovereign authority, and the powers vested
to it under the Constitution and Bylaws, adopted December 10, 1978, and as may be amended from
time to time (“Constitution”). Nothing in this section shall be deemed to waive the sovereign
immunity of the Band or any of its enterprises, officers, agents or employees, nor does the adoption
of the referenced codes require the Band to comply with any laws to which it would not ordinarily
be subject.

() Plumbing Code. The following amendments are hereby made to the Uniform
Plumbing Code:

(1) Add Section 101.1.1. The provision of this code shall not be deemed to
nullify any provisions of law as to the Band’s inherent sovereign authority, and the powers vested
to it under the Constitution and Bylaws, adopted December 10, 1978, and as may be amended from
time to time (“Constitution”). Nothing in this section shall be deemed to waive the sovereign
immunity of the Band or any of its enterprises, officers, agents or employees, nor does the adoption
of the referenced codes require the Band to comply with any laws to which it would not ordinarily
be subject.

(d) Energy Code. The following amendments are hereby made to the International
Energy Conservation Code:

(D Section (C) 106.3 Other laws. This section is to be deleted in its entirety and
replaced with the following: The provision of this code shall not be deemed to nullify any
provisions of law as to the Band’s inherent sovereign authority, and the powers vested to it under
the Constitution and Bylaws, adopted December 10, 1978, and as may be amended from time to
time (“Constitution”). Nothing in this section shall be deemed to waive the sovereign immunity of

Adopted January 28, 2018 7 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Garming Areas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance




the Band or any of its enterprises, officers, agents or employees, nor does the adoption of the
referenced codes require the Band to comply with any laws to which it would not ordinarily be
subject.

(e) Existing Building Code. The following amendments are hereby made to the
International Existing Building Code:

(1)  Section {A) 102.2 Other laws. This section is to be deleted in its entirety
and replaced with the following: The provision of this Code shall not be deemed to nullify any
provisions of law as to the Band’s inherent sovereign authority, and the powers vested to it under
the Constitution and Bylaws, adopted December 10, 1978, and as may be amended from time to
time (“Constitution”). Nothing in this section shall be deemed to waive the sovereign immunity of
the Band or any of its enterprises, officers, agents or employees, nor does the adoption of the
referenced codes require the Band to comply with any laws to which it would not ordinarily be
subject.

3 WUI Code. The following amendments are hereby made to the International
Wildland Urban Interface Code.

(1)  Section (A}102.2 Other [aws. This section is to be deleted in its entirety and
replaced with the following: The provision of this Code shall not be deemed to nullify any
provisions of law as to the Band’s inherent sovereign authority, and the powers vested to it under
the Constitution and Bylaws, adopted December 10, 1978, and as may be amended from time to
time (“Constitution”). Nothing in this section shall be deemed to waive the sovereign immunity of
the Band or any of its enterprises, officers, agents or employees, nor does the adoption of the
referenced codes require the Band to comply with any laws to which it would not ordinarily be
subject.

3] Swimming Pool and Spa Code. The following amendments are hereby made to the
International Swimming Pool and Spa Code:

(1) Section (A)102.9 Other laws. This section is to be deleted in its entirety and
replaced with the following: The provision of this Code shall not be deemed to nullify any
provisions of law as to the Band’s inherent sovereign authority, and the powers vested to it under
the Constitution and Bylaws, adopted December 10, 1978, and as may be amended from time to
time (“Constitution”). Nothing in this section shall be deemed to waive the sovereign immunity of
the Band or any of its enterprises, officers, agents or employees, nor does the adoption of the
referenced codes require the Band to comply with any laws to which it would not ordinarily be
subject.

1.10 Minimum Permit Requirements.

(a) Filing of Applications. Applications for building permits and certifications shall be
filed with the Building Official on forms provided by the Band, and completed by the Applicant.
Applications for fire permits shall be filed with the Fire Code Official on forms provided by the
Pechanga Fire Department, and completed by the Applicant.

Adopted January 28, 2018 8 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Gaming Arcas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



(b) Content of Application. Each application for a building or fire permit must include
the following information:

(1) A description, including maps, plans, engineering reports, shop drawings,
and other relevant data, of the proposed construction, operation, event, or project site and vicinity
sufficient to determine whether the Project complies with the requirements of this Ordinance. The
description shall include sufficient information conceming the existing use of the Building, land,
and water areas in the vicinity of the site of the proposed Project, to the extent that the Applicant
can reasonably ascertain this information for the vicinity surrounding the project site. Construction
documents shall be prepared by a registered design professional unless the Building Official or
Fire Code Official determines it is not necessary for the nature of the Project. All submitted
information, including plans, maps, attachments, etc., must be submitted in a legible format.

(2)  Alegal description of the property upon which the work is to be performed.

(3) A dated signature by the property owner, or owners, authorizing the
processing of the application, and written authorization, if applicable, for an authorized
representative to bind the property owmer in matters concerning the application. Permit
applications for fire protection systems shall be signed by a licensed contractor.

4) Such additional information that the Building Official or Fire Code Official
may determine is necessary to conclude whether the Project is consistent with tribal plans, this
Ordinance, and other tribal laws and regulations.

(5) A statement of understanding that processing of applications which do not
contain truthtul and accurate information necessary to review the application may delay or result
in the denial of the permit or revocation if the inaccurate information is discovered after approval
or issuance of the permit.

©) Construction documents shall contain sufficient information to reflect
compliance with the applicable codes. At a minimum, construction documents to be submitted
shall include plans and specifications as specified within the International Building Code.

(c) Licensed Contractor. The Pechanga Band of Luisefio Indians requires valid
California state licensure for any and all contractors engaged in work that would require a license
under the laws of the State of Califormnia if such work were to be performed outside of the Pechanga
Indian Reservation. Therefore, any contractor performing work subject to this Ordinance must
possess and maintain a current, valid California license. Loss or suspension of said license shall
be reported immediately to the Building Official.

1.11  Permit Application Review.

(a) The Building Official or Fire Code Official shall review all applications for
building and fire permits, and certificates for completeness and accuracy before the applications
are accepted and officially filed as complete. If the application is determined to be incomplete, the
Building Official or Fire Code Official shall send notification of such finding to the Applicant, and
shall indicate what is required for it to be considered complete by mail within thirty (30) calendar

Adopted January 28, 2018 9 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Gaming Areas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



days after receipt of the application. If no response from the Applicant is received within thirty
(30) days of Applicant notification, applications deemed incomplete shall be returned to the
Applicant with any refundable fees that were paid and no further action shall be taken until the
Applicant resubmits the application with the required information.

(b)  During the application check, the Building Official or Fire Code Official may refer
copies of the application to any tribal department that may have relevant authority or expertise.
Along with the referral, the Building Official or Fire Code Official shall include notification that
responses from the departments must be received within ten (10) business days or the Building
Official/Fire Code Official will assume no response is forthcoming. The Building Official or Fire
Code Official is authorized to require owner or owner’s authorized agent to provide, without
charge to the Band, a technical opinion and report prepared by a qualified expert or design
professional. This does not excuse the Applicant of any other requirements that include department
and/or agency notifications.

(c) Where the Building Official or Fire Code Official has determined that an
application is incomplete, and where the Applicant believes that the information requested to
complete the application is not required, the Applicant may request in writing that the Band
schedule a meeting between the Building Official or Fire Code Official and the Applicant within
thirty (30) business days.

(d)  Upon acceptance of an application as complete, the Building Official or Fire Code
Official shall complete a review within thirty (30} business days.

1.12 Building and Fire Permit Approval.

(a)  Occupancy Certificate and Building Permit Approval. Following the completion of
the application review process, consistency certificates and building permits shall be issued by the

Building Official upon compliance with all general regulations applicable to the permitted Project
and all conditions that may be imposed by the permit.

{(b) Fire Permit and Fire Clearance Approval. Following the completion of the fire
permit application review process, consistency with fire permits and/or fire clearance shall be
issued by the Fire Code Official upon compliance with all general regulations applicable to the
permitted Project and all conditions that may be imposed by the permit. Issuance of a fire permit
or fire clearance shall not be construed as approval of any violations of this Ordinance or any other
applicable codes or ordinances, and shall not prohibit the Fire Code Official from requiring
correction of errors.

(c) Other Applicable Rules, Policies and Standards. No building or fire permit shall
be issued until the Building Official or Fire Code Official has received written certification from

applicable tribal departments that the Project for which the Permit is sought complies with all
applicable laws, regulations, rules, policies, and standards of the Band.

Adopted January 28, 2018 10 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Code
Divigion 2: Non-Gaming Areas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



1.13 Issuance of Building and Fire Permits.

(a) Building Permit Issuance. The issuance of a building permit authorizes the
Applicant to undertake the proposed Project immediately upon the effective date of the permit,
subject to all conditions or restrictions imposed by the permit; provided, however, that all other
permits, plans, certificates, and other grants of approval are secured before the Project may
commence. Issuance of a building permit shall not be construed as approval of any violations of
this Ordinance or any other applicable codes or ordinances, and shall not prohibit the Building
Official from requiring correction of errors in documents or other data.

(b)  Fire Permit Issuance. The issuance of a fire permit authorizes the Applicant to
undertake the proposed Project immediately upon the effective date of the permit, subject to all
conditions or restrictions imposed by the permit; provided, however, that all other permits, plans,
certificates, and other grants of approval are secured before the Project may commence. Issuance
of a fire permit shall not be construed as approval of any violations of this Ordinance or any other
applicable codes or ordinances, and shall not prohibit the Fire Code Official from requiring
correction of errors in documents or other data.

(c) Subsequent Property Owners. A building permit is assignable to subsequent
property owners, subject to approval by the Band, but such assignment does not discharge any
conditions or obligations of the permit. Fire permits are not assignable.

(d) Policy Changes. A change in the policies, procedures, codes, or ordinances that
become effective after a building or fire permit has been issued shall not apply to the permit or to
whom the permit was issued. The person must adhere to the conditions of the original permit,
unless expired.

(e) Building Permit Expirations. A building permit shall expire and become void at the
time specified in such permit, when revoked, or if no time is specified, it shall expire if work has
not commenced within 180 days of issuance, or if work is suspended or abandoned for a period of
180 days.

§9) Fire Permit Expirations.

(1)  An operational fire permit shall expire and become void at the time
specified in such permit, when revoked, or if no tiine is specified, at the expiration of one (1) year
after issuance.

(2) A construction fire permit shall expire if work has not commenced within
180 days or work is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 days.

3) A new fire permit is required upon change in occupancy, operation, tenancy,
or ownership.

Adopted January 28,2018 11 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Gaming Areas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



1.14 Fees.

(2)  Establishment of Fee Schedule. The Tribal Council may revise or change the fee
schedule without amending this Ordinance. Costs will be, at a minimum, a set cost per square foot.
Such a fee schedule will be available with each application.

(b)  Processing Costs.

(1)  Initial Fees and Deposit. Initial fees and an initial deposit shall be paid with
submission of any application based on a set cost per square foot and the valuation of the Project.
Fire department fees will be set based on the type of permit or number of hours required for service.
Cost recovery fees for emergency response generated by a person(s) acting negligently,
intentionally, or in violation of the law will be determined by Tribal Council.

(2) Processing Costs. The Applicant is responsible for all title company,
engineering, cultural, environmental (including both the initial review, as well as costs associated
with additional environmental assessment, if required), surveying, legal, and any county or city
fees incurred in connection with the processing and approval of plans and maps including review
and approval by an engineering firm as well as special inspections, and technical reports required
to verify compliance with this Ordinance.

(3)  Nonpayment of Fees. In the event that fees are not paid by an Applicant
when due, no further processing of the building or fire permit application shall occur.

(c) Fees are Nonrefundable. All fees due under this Ordinance are nonrefundable,
unless specified otherwise. An Applicant shall be reimbursed any funds paid that exceed actual
costs incurred by the Band under this Ordinance.

1.15 Variances.

(a) General. Requests for a variance will be evaluated by the Fire Code Official and
the Building Official to ensure the proposed design, use, or operation satisfactorily complies with
the intent of the Applicable Codes. The Fire Code Official and Building Official shall base their
determination on technical justifications, and have the right to attach such conditions to variances
as deemed necessary to further the purposes and objectives of this Ordinance. Additionally, the
alternative means and methods being proposed will be evaluated to determine whether they are at
least equivalent to that prescribed in the Applicable Codes in quality, strength, effectiveness, fire
resistance, durability, and safety.

(b)  Records. The Fire Code Official and Building Official shall maintain a permanent
record of all variance actions, including justification for their issuance.

(c) Genera] Requirements. The Applicant shall provide the following information, in
writing, with complete and adequate copies of the appropriate plans and docuinents necessary to
clearly evaluate the Project and request for a variance:

(1) Identify relevant Project information;

Adopted January 28,2018 12 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Gaming Areas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



(2)  Identify the code section numbers or reference the specific requirement for
which the variance or alternative means is requested;

(3) Provide a background statement to identify, explain or otherwise detail the
situation causing the request for a variance; and

(4)  Detail the alternative means and methods as part of the variance proposal
and how they establish equivalency to those prescribed in the Applicable Codes.

{d)  Engineering Evaluation. If the Fire Code Official or the Building Official
determines that a peer review or other engineering evaluation by a licensed professional eugineer
is necessary, it shall be performed and reported by a firm or individual that has been approved by
the Fire Code Official and Building Official at the expense of the Applicant.

(e) Submittal Process.

¢y At least two (2) copies of the variance proposal letter (or approved variance
request form) and other supporting information is required. Submit one (1) copy to the Fire Code
Official and one (1) copy to the Building Official.

(2)  Variance requests will be evaluated on a case-by-case basis. Approval of
the request is based upon several factors, including, but not limited to:

(1) The level of equivalency achieved;

(i1) The effect of the variance and other related conditions or issues that
will be beneficial or not beneficial to the best interests of the Band; and

(iii)  All evaluations will be performed in the context of the specific
project being reviewed.

(3) If the variance proposal provides an equivalent level of protection
considering all related conditions and issues pertaining to the project, the Fire Code Official and
Building Official will issue a response letter granting approval of the variance. Such approval may
be conditional upon implementation of additional requirements listed in the variance response
letter that were not part of the original variance proposal. Approval is granted only for the specific
project under review and the conditions for approval shall not be construed as applicable to any
other project nor should any approval be considered to establish any precedent for future variance
approvals.

(4)  Inthe event that the variance proposal does not provide an equivalent level
of protection, the request will be denied and a response letter (or variance request form with the
“Not Approved” box marked) will be issued. Should the Applicant submit a different variance
request for this Project or choose to revise and resubmit the previously denied request, additional
variance review fees will apply. To facilitate the evaluation process, the Applicant should include
any previously denied variance proposals when submitting a revised variance request.

Adopted January 28, 2018 13 Title & Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Gaming Areas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



(5)  Upon completion of the evaluation, the variance response letter/form and a
copy of the Applicant’s variance proposal will be electronically delivered to the Applicant, or
available from the Fire Code Official or Building Official. If evaluation of the variance proposal
requires time and resources beyond the standard allotted for this activity, additional time and
material fees may be applied. These additional fees must be paid when the Applicant picks up the
variance response letter/form.

(6) The approved variance proposals and response letters/forms must be copied
on the plans prior to permit approval. Applicants must retain a copy of the variance proposal and
response at the Project site at all times. All approved variances require an inspection approval by
the Fire Code Official or Building Official.

1.16 Enforcement. The Building Official and Fire Code Official shall admimister, enforce, and
render interpretations of all provisions of this Ordinance.

1.17  Right of Entry. The Building Official and the Fire Code Official have the right of entry as
provided for in the Applicable Codes.

1.18 Notice to Correct or Stop Order. A notice to correct or stop order shall be served in
accordance with the following provisions, unless otherwise set forth in this Ordinance:

(a) When a violation of this Code is discovered which can be corrected, the Building
Official or Fire Code Official shall 1ssue a notice to correct in order to notify the responsible party
of the violations, and to order that the violation be corrected within a reasonable time. Unless a
different period is specifically set forth in this Ordinance or an immediate life safety hazard exists,
ten (10) calendar days shall be considered a reasonable time to correct any violation.

(b The notice to correct shall be in writing and must set forth the facts that constitute
the violation, the specific provisions of this Ordinance that have been violated, the specific acts
required to correct the violation, the time allowed to correct the violation, and the rights to appeal
the notice to comrect. If the violation is related to a license or permit, the notice to correct may be
accompanied by a stop order which orders the responsible party to immediately stop any and all
work on the Project that is subject to the permit until the violation is corrected. The notice to
correct shall be posted on the subject property and/or sent via first class mail to all responsible
patties.

(c) If the violation that is the subject of the notice to correct concerns the failure to
apply for and/or obtain a valid building or fire permit, the time allowed to apply for a permit shall
be no less than seven (7) calendar days, and no more than thirty (30) calendar days. A stop order
shall accompany the notice to correct, and shall remain in effect pending review of and decision
on any permit application.

(d)  Ifthe violation that is the subject of the notice to correct concerns (1) the failure to
comply with conditions placed on a permit or other entitlement issued by the Band, or (2) a
violation of any provision of this Ordinance, the time allowed to correct the violation shall be a
mimmum of twenty-four (24) hours and a maximum of ninety (90) calendar days, depending upon

Adopted January 28, 2018 14 Title 8; Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Gaming Areas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



the type of action that will be necessary to correct the violation. If the violation creates a potential
risk of harm to persons or property, a stop order shall accompany the notice to correct, and shall
remain in effect until the violation has been remedied to the satisfaction of the Building Official
or Fire Code Official.

(e) If the Building Official or Fire Code Official determines that there has been a good
faith effort to correct the violation(s) set forth in a notice to correct, the official may extend the
deadline for compliance for a reasonable period of time. Any such extension shall be memorialized
in writing and a copy sent by first class mail to all responsible parties.

1.19 Notice of Administrative Violation. A notice of administrative violation of this Ordinance
may be issued for the following circumstances:

(a) When the violation can be corrected, a notice of correction has been served, and the
specified time has passed without adequate correction of the violation;

{b) When a stop order has been issued and has not been complied with by the
responsible party; or

(c) When the same violation has been committed by the same responsible party within
the past twelve (12) months and a notice to correct or notice of administrative violation has been
served on the responsible party within that same twelve (12) month period.

1.20 Penalties.

(2) Unless the Tribal Council establishes a different penalty, administrative violations
shall be subject to a fine in the amount of one-hundred dollars ($100.00) per day each day the
violation persists. Fines shall be charged against the responsible party, subject to the determination
of the Building Official and/or Fire Code Official, at the timie of the violation. Failure to pay any
fine issued under this section within thirty (30) calendar days may result in the suspension,
revocation, or denial of any permit issued to the responsible party pursuant to this Ordinance.

(b) Prior to the suspension, revocation, or denial of any permit, or the assessment of
any fee or penalty, or the commencement of any other enforcement action pursuant to this
Ordinance, the Building Official or Fire Code Official shall follow the procedures set forth in
Sections 2.16-2.20 of this Ordinance.

(c) In the event of any conflict between this Ordinance and any law, rule or regulation
of the Federal Government, that requirement which establishes the higher standard of safety shall
govern. Failure to comply with such standard of safety shall be a violation of this Ordinance.

1.21 Administrative Appeal Process.

(a) Applicants may file appeals of decisions or determinations made by the Building
Official or Fire Code Official relative to the application and interpretation of this Ordinance. Any
such appeal must be submitted within fifteen (15) days after the date of such decision or
determination.

Adopted January 28, 2018 15 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Gaming Areas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



(b) Appellants shall be allowed to present evidence in support of their appeal during a
hearing before the Tribal Council. The Tribal Council will retain subject matter experts to assist
and advise any appeal filed hereunder as deemed necessary. The Tribal Council shall render a final
decision with respect to the decision or determination being appealed. The process described in
this Section is within the exclusive jurisdiction of the Pechanga Band and its agencies and officers,
and is the sole recourse for any person filing an appeal pursuant to this Ordinance.

1.22 Tribal Court Jurisdiction. The Pechanga Tribal Court shall have jurisdiction over all
matters arising from or related to this Ordinance; provided, however, that the Administrative
Appeal Process in Section 1.21 shall be the exclusive remedy for those matters relative to the
application or interpretation of this Ordinance.

1.23  Sovereign Immunity. Nothing in this Ordinance shall be deemed to waive the sovereign
immunity of the Band or any of its enterprises, officers, agents or employees.

1.24 Effective Date. This Ordinance shall take effect upon its adoption by the General
Membership.

1.25 Amendments. This Ordinance may be amended or repealed only by a majority vote of the
General Membership of the Pechanga Band, acting at a duly noticed meeting.

1.26 Non-Substantive Revisions. Non-substantive revisions to this Ordinance, formatting and

other technical revisions that do not affect the substance and meaning of the provisions, may be
made by the Tribal Council.

Adopted Jannary 28, 2018 16 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Gaming Areas
Article 1: Non-Gaming Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



CERTIFICATION

The undersigned, the duly authorized Secretary of the Temecula Band of Luisefio Mission Indians,
sometimes referred to as the Pechanga Band of Mission Indians, federally recognized as the
Pechanga Band of Luisefio Mission Indians, does hereby certify that the foregoing Non-Gaming
Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance {(Pechanga Code of Ordinances Title 8, Division 2,
Article 1) was adopted via General Membership Resolution No. 180128-05a at a duly called
General Membership Meeting held on the 28t day of January, 2018, by a vote of 110 yes, 3 no,
and 2 abstaining, and that such Resolution has not been rescinded or amended in any way.

Dated: _ February 29, 2018

Louisé Burke
Tribal Secretary

Adopted January 28, 2018 17 Title 8: Building & Fire Safety Code
Division 2: Non-Gaming Areas
Article I; Non-Gaining Non-Residential Building and Fire Ordinance



